
SOCIAL REPORT 2021 
* KEDIF 

 

On a daily basis we serve 21 beneficiaries of KEDIF and other people 
outside KEDIF who attend a personalized program and receive various 
services such as physical therapy, occupational therapy, psychological 
support – training programs and at the same time participate in various 
groups of recreational and sports activities. 

So far, a total of 36 people have benefited. 

 

* Keada 

 

In the Center for autonomous living education in 2021, a total of 25 
individual and 3 group trainings were implemented. 

* Total accommodated 40 people 

* COOPERATION WITH EOPPY 

From May 2021, the Association started the cooperation with EOPYY 
where the insured beneficiaries who are not included in the program of 
KEDIF funded by the European Community Fund have the possibility of 
compensation from their fund. TOTAL 26 BENEFICIARIES 

 

 

* EXERCISE IN WATER 

 

In the winter of 2021, the ASN program was implemented at the facilities 
of SEFAA Duth and from the beginning of June, meetings – visits were 
held with the officials of the municipality but also with individuals of the 
beach shops for the correct installation of corridors and toilets for the 
disabled and as soon as they were prepared, the program began it was 
attended by 25 beneficiaries of the KEDIF Center for the autonomous 
living of the Disabled of The PERPATO Association but also benefited 
members of the Association who attended the program in the winter 
months at the swimming pool. The program was implemented by the 
responsible Physical Education Teachers George Trikas and Fotini 
Sarridou on a weekly basis twice a week. Due to the increased demand in 
the program, the other therapists and volunteers of the Center participated 
as support staff. 

A total of 40 people participated in the ASN program for 2021 

 

* VOLUNTEER TRAINING 



In 2021, 3 group trainings of volunteers were organized but due to the 
pandemic and increased cases and according to health measures, most 
trainings were held in smaller groups or at an individual level. A TOTAL 
OF 80 VOLUNTEERS 

 

* NEW ENTRIES : 10 NEW MEMBERS 

 

 

* 20 EXPLANATORY FILES WERE PREPARED FOR THE DISABILITY 
CERTIFICATION COMMITTEE (KEPA). 

 

* 14 visits were made to their homes 

beneficiaries of the association with the aim of recording their living 
conditions, assessing the degree of accessibility but also to provide 
nursing assistance or counseling support. 

* 47 COUNSELING SESSIONS OF PSYCHOSOCIAL SUPPORT AND 
GUIDANCE FOR THE PURCHASE OF EQUIPMENT WERE HELD. 

 

* 22 REFERENCES TO SOCIAL SERVICES AND STRUCTURES 

Social support for appropriate support or to cover basic livelihood needs 
of the beneficiaries. 

 

 

* 43 REFERRALS TO DOCTORS FOR MEDICAL COVERAGE BUT 
ALSO COMPLETION OF REFERRAL FILES TO KEPA. 

 

* 1 Paralympic day 120 students. DUE TO THE PANDEMIC, THE 
INTEGRATION INTO SCHOOLS HAS BEEN TIGHTENED, BUT ALSO 
THE CONDUCT OF EXTRACURRICULAR ACTIVITIES. 

 

* Transfers with the two vans : daily transfers with a van to visit doctors/ 
insurance/ welfare/ events/ swimming pool/ Sea . TOTAL 1737 ROUTES 

 

 

* EQUIPMENT LENDING: TOTAL 19 EQUIPMENT LENDING 

LIKE STROLLERS, BED STROLLERS, BATH STROLLERS. 

 



* WE HAVE RECEIVED A TOTAL OF 50 DONATIONS 

 

DETAILS: WHEELCHAIRS(3), BATH CARRIAGE (2), ELECTRIC 
SCOOTER (1) , ELECTRIC BEDS (4), AIR MATTRESS (1), CRUTCHES 
(10), SKALA MOBIL (1), BACTERIA (5) SHEETS (50), VARIOUS 
EQUIPMENT AND DAILY AIDS, CONSUMABLES, MEDICINES, MASKS, 

Dialysers, urine collectors, suffixes and various other items which are put 
to use to meet the needs of the uninsured and helpless beneficiaries of 
the Association but also beneficiaries of other social structures. 

 

Contact 

 

* Cooperation with the IOM (International Organization of migrants) 
Department of Thessaloniki for hospitality and participation in the program 
of education of autonomous living in the Keada disabled guest that they 
had in the structure of Serres. 

* Smile of the child to cover travel and accommodation expenses of the 
beneficiary of the Association 

* Tommy (local health units) 4th Health District 

* CEFIAP KOMOTINI 

* Child and Family Support Center of children'S villages 

SOS. 

* COMMUNITY CENTER OF THE MUNICIPALITY OF KOMOTINI 

* HELP AT HOME 

* SOCIAL SERVICE OF THE MUNICIPALITY OF KOMOTINI (SOUP 
KITCHEN) 

* COMMUNITY CENTER OF THE MUNICIPALITY OF MARONEIA-
SAPON 

 

 

• THE SECOND VAN THAT WAS PURCHASED WITH VISA 
SPONSORSHIP AND HAS BEEN MODIFIED CONTINUED TO BE 
AVAILABLE FOR DRIVING LESSONS AND IN TOTAL 2 
BENEFICIARIES TOOK DRIVING LESSONS AND TOOK EXAMS AND 
GOT THEIR DRIVING DIPLOMAS. 

 

 

AS A FRAMEWORK OF PRACTICAL EXERCISE, THE PERPATO 
ASSOCIATION ACCEPTED 



 

* 14 Social Administration students (out of 14 students, six completed 
their internship with a distance program due to Covid 19) 

* 2 STUDENTS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF PHYSIOTHERAPY ATEI 
THESSALONIKI AND UNIVERSITY OF AIGIO. 

* 1 STUDENT FROM IEK DEPARTMENT OF OCCUPATIONAL 
THERAPY ASSISTANT 

 

* 2 STUDENTS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL 
ADMINISTRATION – POLITICAL SCIENCE 

* 17 students from SEFAA of Duth 

 

TOTAL 36 STUDENTS 

 

Yours sincerely 

 

 

 

VILDAN YUSUF SOCIAL WORKER – 

PROJECT  
 


